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DATE ACTIVITY PRICE TIME MEETING PLACE DESCRIPTION

Tue,
Sept 2

FlyOver
Canada $30 3.45 PM Granville Campus

Soar across Canada's stunning landscapes with this thrilling
virtual flight experience. A breathtaking adventure from coast
to coast!

Wed,
Sept 3 Welcome Pancakes FREE 8 AM Granville Campus

Start the day sweet! Dig into fluffy pancakes with maple
syrup. A warm welcome to our new students never tasted so
good!

Thu,
Sept 4

Sunset Kayak at 
Jericho Beach $55 5 PM Granville Campus

Kayak across the calm waters at Jericho Beach as the sun
sets over Vancouver’s skyline. Enjoy breathtaking views and
tranquility, the perfect way to end your day in nature! Zone 1

Fri,
Sept 5 The Amazing Race IV FREE 12.30 PM Granville Campus

(Room 307)

Compete in teams across Vancouver, tackle wild challenges at
surprise checkpoints, and race for a BIG prize (winners will
share a $400 prize!). Fast-paced fun, friendly rivalry, and epic
memories guaranteed! Last sign-up day, September 3rd!

Mon,
Sept 8

Picnic at Queen 
Elizabeth Park FREE 3.45 PM Hastings Campus

Take a stroll through one of Vancouver’s most stunning parks
while having a picnic with friends. You can also visit the
conservatory and enjoy tropical temperatures and exotic
birds! Zone 1

Tue,
Sept 9

Quarry Rock 
(Deep Cove) FREE 3.45 PM Granville Campus

Take in the views on this classic North Shore hike! Quarry
Rock offers a moderate trail through the forest ending with a
stunning lookout over Deep Cove. Don’t forget your camera
and comfy shoes! Zone 2

Wed,
Sept 10

Capilano 
Suspension Bridge $59 3.45 PM Hastings Campus

Walk high above the forest! This thrilling experience offers
lush trees and serene landscapes stretching out below you.
Zone 2 

Thu,
Sept 11 Yoga with Stacey FREE 3.45 PM Granville Campus Join Stacey for a rejuvenating yoga session. A great way to

stretch, relax, and unwind! Open to all levels.

Fri,
Sept 12

Ropes at 
Grouse Mountain $47 1 PM Hastings Campus Climb, swing, and zip your way through the treetops—

adrenaline with a mountain view at Grouse Mountain! Zone 2

Mon,
Sept 15 Vancouver Lookout $13 3.45 PM Hastings Campus See Vancouver like never before! Take in the sweeping views

from a 360° new perspective of the city.

Tue,
Sept 16

Whitecaps 
Championship Semifinals! $35 5 PM Granville Campus

Cheer the Whitecaps (and their newest star, Thomas Müller!)
as they battle for a spot in the Canadian Championship final!
All signed-up students will be entered into a draw for an
official Whitecaps jersey. Don’t miss your chance… you
might be the lucky one!

Wed,
Sept 17 Granville Island Bring $ 3.45 PM Granville Campus

Hop on the Aquabus for a scenic ride to Granville Island!
Explore the public market, check out unique artisan shops,
and enjoy the vibrant atmosphere. Zone 1 + Aquabus ticket

Thu,
Sept 18

Biking:
Stanley Park $20 3.45 PM Granville Campus

Explore the beauty of Stanley Park on two wheels! Enjoy a
scenic ride around the seawall, with some memorable photo
stops.

Fri,
Sept 19 Corn Maze at Chilliwack $65 1 PM Hastings Campus

Get lost at the iconic Chilliwack Corn Maze! Wander through
winding paths cut into towering corn stalks, with twists and
turns! Included: transportation + admission

Mon,
Sept 22 Let’s go for an ice cream! Bring $ 3.45 PM Granville Campus

Treat yourself to a sweet escape! Dive into creamy scoops,
crunchy cones, and all your favorite toppings. A cool delight
for every kind of day!

Tue,
Sept 23 Lynn Canyon FREE 3.45 PM Hastings Campus Cross the beautiful (and free!) suspension bridge, and enjoy

an easy hike along forest trails and waterfalls. Zone 2

Thu,
Sept 25

Conversation
Pub Bring $ 3.45 PM Hastings Campus Practice your English, meet new people, and enjoy a great

time together! 19+ / bring your ID + Passport

Fri,
Sept 26

Heritage Village 
at Burnaby FREE 1 PM Granville Campus

Step back in time at Burnaby Village Museum! Explore a
charming 1920s village complete with heritage homes, a
vintage carousel, old-style shops. It’s a fun and interactive
way to experience local history! Zone 3

Mon,
Sept 29 Bowling $15 3.45 PM Granville Campus

Step up for a fun twist on traditional bowling! Try your hand
at Canadian 5-pin bowling with smaller balls and precision
challenges! Zone 1

Wed,
Oct 1 Welcome Pancakes FREE 8 AM Hastings Campus

Start the day sweet! Dig into fluffy pancakes with maple
syrup. A warm welcome to our new students never tasted so
good!

Thu,
Oct 2 Lighthouse Park hike FREE 3.45 PM Granville Campus Escape the city for an afternoon hike through lush forests

and stunning ocean views. Nature is calling! Zone 2

Fri,
Oct 3 Treewalk at UBC $20 1 PM Granville Campus

Walk among the treetops on this breathtaking adventure! The
UBC Treewalk offers a series of suspension bridges through
the forest canopy, with stunning views and a fresh
perspective on nature! Zone 1


